
passenger seen in bombing truck
By The A ssociated  Press

OKLAHOMA CITY — Videotape 
from a surveillance camera cap­
tured a glimpse of a shadowy fig- 
u re in the passenger seat of the 
b omb-laden Ryder truck minutes 
b efore it blew apart the federal 
b u ilding, a federal law enforce­
m en t source says.

The footage is not clear enough 
to identify anyone, but it adds to 
the body of evidence that a third

figure — perhaps the long-sought 
John Doe No. 2 — took part in the 
attack with Timothy McVeigh and 
Terry Nichols, the source told The 
Associated Press in an interview 
this week.

“There’s a shape in there, but 
they can’t see a face,” the source 
said of footage, taken by a camera 
on a nearby apartment building. 
The camera picked up the shad­
owy passenger about three min­

utes before the bomb went off 
April 19 at the Alfred P. Murrah 
Building.

The government says McVeigh 
drove to Oklahoma City in the 
truck, parked it in front of the fed­
eral building and made his get­
away in a yellow Mercury Mar­
quis. But prosecutors have given 
no indication that Nichols was al­
so in Oklahoma City the day of the 
bombing.


